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Abstract 
 
The purpose of this article is to explain a new teaching method 
through the insertion of a new class in Chinese primary schools 
to teach Chinese characters in a creative and more leisurely 
way. Our support class will use the learning of the pictographic 
characters from their origin. Chinese culture, and its evolution, 
is deeply linked to the Chinese writing system; thus, the 
Chinese characters are a rich store of Chinese culture, yet at the 
same time, they are one of the most difficult tasks for new 
learners. With a reforming of the teaching method in a creative 
way, students not only memorize the Chinese characters, but 
also learn their own history, the evolution of the culture, and 
the customs through creative practice, aesthetics and, in 
general, the art skills. These combine with illustration and 
drawing techniques, stressing creative and interesting learning, 
and a number of skills that too often are not taught in Chinese 
schools, such as cooperation, interactivity, critical skills and so 
on. Our purpose is to stress the cultural and artistic field of 
learning; the teaching method should be balanced between 
learning new knowledge, not just in mnemonic way, and 
exercising the creative side of the brain to build a healthy mind, 
learn how to use their own mental capacity and their own skills, 
with the added benefit of an improvement in their critical 
thinking skills. The Chinese teaching system is more open and 
flexible. Every school decides its own study program 
independently. Consequently, this situation is particularity 
favorable for our will. In each school, we can build a suitable 
study program based on the connection of our class with all the 
other classes in the school to create a system of cooperation 
and communication between the teachers. So far, this teaching 
is based on the teachings of Chinese characters, but we feel it 
can also be an effective and useful source of inspiration for the 
teachers of standard classes of Chinese language to avoid a dull 
and ineffective way of teaching. In the Chinese educational 
system and, in general, in Chinese ideology, Chinese language 
classes are the key for the education of Chinese children. 
 
Key words: Illustration, Chinese pictograph, new teaching 
method, language and aesthetic learning. 

  
Introduction 

 
The purpose of this article is to introduce a new way in 
education for primary schools in China. In our experience the 
Chinese education system to some degree is losing the creative 
power of learning because, the teaching method is generally 
based on mnemonic skills. This way of learning can be very 
tiring and boring for young students; they can easily lose the 
passion for study, their mental agility and repress their talents 

and sense of criticism. To build a healthy mind, the teaching 
method should be balanced between acquiring new knowledge, 
not just mnemonically (passive learning) as well as exercising 
the creative side of the brain (active learning). We will stress 
the cultural and artistic field of learning, but at the same time, 
our students will become more open-minded; in this way they 
can more easily face any kind of learning and interest, in the 
academic field and also in personal growth.  
 
The Chinese culture (humanities and arts) and its evolution is 
deeply linked to the Chinese writing system (汉字 hànzì); thus, 
the Chinese characters are a rich store of Chinese culture, 
while at the same time being one of the most difficult tasks for 
new learners. In reforming the teaching method creatively, 
students will not only memorize the Chinese characters but 
will learn their own history, the evolution of the culture and 
customs through the practice of being creative, aesthetics and 
the art skills generally. It is important to merge traditional 
knowledge with a creative spirit to prepare the new generations 
to face modern society with a strong critical sense. 
 
Specifically, we want to use the teaching of the pictographic 
and ideographic character to build a bridge between traditional 
culture and world of art. These kinds of characters (we can call 
them logographic characters) are one of the first expressions of 
the Chinese mind: the representation of the surrounding world, 
its interpretation and the needs of communication. Often, the 
early writing symbols are logographic. We can find this kind of 
character everywhere in the world, from the American 
continent to Asia, but mostly, they are the first step in the 
evolution of a writing system. We can find good examples in 
the cuneiform scripts or in Egyptian hieroglyphs, but with the 
evolution of the respective societies, they lose their own iconic 
power to become phonetic characters, as they disappear totally 
with the decline of their own civilizations or because of the 
influence of another cultural system. Also, in non-literate 
cultures, we can find the same needs for representation of the 
world such as the ancient petroglyphs scattered globally. All 
such kinds of writing show the necessity of self-expression (in 
art and communication) in a growing civilization, but they all 
belong to history and the past. In the contemporary world, just 
the Chinese writing system is a direct evolution from its 
logographic roots. Because of this unique quality of Chinese 
characters, it is possible to fuse both artistic and linguistic 
learning into one teaching method. In fact, the contemporary 
pictographic and ideographic characters are the direct 
evolution of the ancient ones. They were subjected to a long 
process of abstraction but still exist in the “picture” aspect. In 
this way, it is possible to treat them as a kind of illustration and 
link this with the artistic practice and learning. Nowadays, the 
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majority of writing systems are purely phonetic with the result 
of a near total absence of iconic aspect; the words are just the 
expression of the sound and it is very difficult to see any kind 
of cultural aspect in them.  
 

Teaching method  
 
The modern Chinese writing system is the result of thousands 
of years of evolution; we can still find its logographic origin 
and its iconic power is still very strong. Consequently, the 
reading process between logographic and phonetic writing 
systems is also different: the phonetic system is the 
representation of the sound of the word and so the reader first 
recognizes the sound and then connects it to the meaning; in 
the logographic system, there is no step to identify the sound 
but there is a direct link from the graphical representation of 
the word to its meaning. This aspect is very important; in fact, 
the mental reading process of Chinese characters is the same as 
that used during reading images. When we read a phonetic 
word, our eyes and our brain proceed in a linear decryption of 
each element, linking the first symbol to the second until the 
end of the word. When we read Chinese characters, all their 
elements simultaneously give us the meaning, and once again, 
it is the same process to read an image [1]. With this premise, 
step by step we explain how learning Chinese logographic 
characters and their evolution could improve young students’ 
knowledge and their artistic, aesthetic, creative and critical 
skills. 
 
As stated before, the modern Chinese characters are the result 
of an abstraction process from the primitive logographic 
characters. This is a natural evolution of a writing system such 
as the cuneiform scripts, because the mental evolution and its 
sophistication has a natural tendency to remove the redundant 
elements. The Chinese characters, in opposition to other 
writing systems, did not lose their iconic origin, nor change 
their nature and, exactly because of this, we can find many 
cultural aspects nestled in them. We can explain some 
examples to understand how it is possible to find cultural 
elements inside the characters. 
 
How Chinese characters describe the ancient customs: in the 
group of the composed characters, the logograms with the 
radical 154 貝bèi (from the Kangxi system of radicals 
康熙部首Kāngxī bùshŏu) refer to the semantic group related 
to money. However, the meaning of this word is shell. Where 
is the relation with money? Is this because during ancient times 
Chinese people used shells as currency for an exchange of 
goods? The modern word for money is 钱 qián. It has the 
radical 167 金 jīn, meaning metal, but this character is much 
younger than 貝, meaning, in a later period, the Chinese people 
started to use metal as a currency. 
 
How Chinese characters could sometimes describe ancient 
customs better than archaeological discovery: for example, the 
oldest inscription on bamboo slips (竹简 zhújiăn) come from 
the Spring and Autumn Period (770-476 B.C.). Therefore, by 
just basing this on the archaeological sources, we cannot argue 
that the Chinese people used this writing support before this 
period. Yet, if we look at the history of Chinese characters, we 
discover that the pictographic word for bamboo slips (冊cè) is 

much older because we found it inscribed on the oracle bones 
from the Shang dynasty (16th-11th century B.C.). This is an 
unassailable proof of their antiquity. 
 
How can Chinese characters describe the Chinese mind and 
ideas: if we take, as an example, the word 好hăo, it means 
good and, looking at its structure, in fact it is a composed 
character whose two elements are 女nǚ, girl, and子zǐ, boy. 
Consequently, we can easily understand that in Chinese culture, 
the union of a young couple has a positive meaning, probably 
one the most important aspects of society. It is possible to find 
this character from the very early times and there are many on 
the oracle bone inscriptions, telling us that it is one of the basic 
values of Chinese thinking.  
 
Some Chinese characters bring specific historical and 
legendary notions: for example, the character 虹 hóng, 
rainbow, in the early scripts seems to be an animal with two 
heads. This is because the ancient Chinese people explained 
the meteorological phenomenon with the legend of the 
doubled-headed animal, and we can also find this idea in some 
ancient books such as the Classic of Mountains and 
Seas《山海经》Shānhǎijīng or in the Book of 
Han《汉书》Hàn shū. With the introduction of characters 
such as these, we can teach legends or historical facts. 
Listening to a story is also highly appreciated by young 
students and gives some notions about ancient texts (this is 
important because in further studies, they will acquire this kind 
of knowledge). Later they can use the story to draw one or 
more pictures, also using the characters learned before. 
 
Teaching children this kind of knowledge and for them to learn 
it could seem complicated, but the iconic power of Chinese 
characters can make our task much easier. In fact, for them, 
learning about ancient culture or Chinese characters could be 
very boring; we have to find the right way to keep their interest. 
For children, a favorite activity is drawing and exactly because 
of this, we will use drawing as a teaching method to turn on 
their interest, their passion and stimulate the learning of these 
difficult topics. As for the primitive cultures, drawing was the 
easiest and the first way of expression. This is the same for the 
children’s mind because drawing is one of the most natural 
activities of human expressiveness. Our teaching material is 
based on the ancient characters; in particular, we will take 
examples from the oracle bone inscriptions (甲骨文 jiăgŭwėn), 
inscriptions on bronze objects, such as a tripod (金文 jīnwén) 
and in general, the seal scripts (篆书zhuànshũ) from the early 
inscriptions until the Eastern Han Dynasty (东汉 Dōng Hàn) 
when the Shuōwén Jiĕzì《说文解字注》was written, one of 
the earliest important Chinese dictionaries. We will introduce 
several characters to them. Inside the ancient characters, there 
is a high degree of drawing and we can use this to teach, 
educate, and develop the different skills of the children. 
 
Our class will be taught at primary school. Naturally, the 
teaching program has to be in harmony with the school’s 
teaching method and it should develop year by year, following 
the students’ learning. In China, primary school takes six years 
of learning and as the other classes, our lessons have to be 
planned for each grade. This way of teaching will be a 
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supplementary class and not a substitute. For this reason, the 
teachers have to cooperate with each other to create dynamic 
and coherent teaching. Thus, the characters the children will 
learn with our method have to be the same as those they will 
learn in the standard Chinese language class.  
 
Another important point of our teaching method is the 
interdisciplinary aspect. As already stated, they will learn the 
Chinese language, historical and cultural notions, drawing 
painting and writing. This way of teaching is very important 
because it will develop the brain’s agility and the connection 
skills between different kinds of majors and knowledge, with a 
cross-sectional and longitudinal study.  This will allow them to 
understand that the culture, history, art, and language are all 
related, are all different aspects of human life and at the same 
time, are deeply connected. This kind of synergy is important 
for the students in understanding that everything they study is 
related to life. They can understand the value of what they are 
learning, and the interdisciplinary aspect is also a good way to 
develop and strengthen the cooperation between teachers to 
create a much more dynamic and rich working background. 
This supplementary class will be the keystone of the 
cooperation between teachers, concerning the interactivity and 
intercommunication between the different majors to train the 
brain of each child to have a wide point of view and to open 
their minds and let them understand how important it is to have 
an agile mind. Compiling an adequate teaching program is 
extremely important. The new class has to consider the level of 
the students to promote balanced learning. The cultural and 
historical knowledge has to be taught in a creative way to build 
a stimulating environment. The children have to learn this 
notion without too much effort but with fun and an easygoing 
approach. This is another limit of the Chinese teaching system; 
the students have to learn a huge quantity of concepts and 
information in a mnemonic way. Memory is important but has 
to be associated with active and creative thinking, not just for 
improving different brain skills, but also to let the learning 
process be less arduous and more exiting.  
 
Above are listed the main purposes of our class and how to 
attend to them. As stated before, all our teaching material 
comes from the standard classes, and so we will reinforce their 
knowledge about what they have already learned, and at the 
same time, the students will learn some new notions (also these 
related to their study course), which will be reused in the 
standard classes. This new knowledge will not interfere with 
the standard learning because there is less in total and spread 
over different classes, but it is very useful in enriching the 
interdisciplinary aspect of the learning. Thus, our teaching 
proposals follow the standard teaching, and year by year, they 
develop side by side. 
 
Improving the imagination: based on the characters they 
learned before, some pictographs and some ideographs 
(depending on the grade of the class), some with a single 
element and some composed of more elements, we will let 
them create new logographic characters to focus and 
concentrate their mind on a creation of symbols functional to 
the communication and not just a descriptive picture of the 
reality. Thus, at the same time, they will develop the 
abstraction power of their brain and rational thinking. They 
will emulate the creation process of the ancient and primitive 

human mind. The children’s brain and the archaic human brain 
have some aspects in common: neither are influenced by 
(modern) society and are much closer to the natural world. At 
the beginning, they will create pictographs with just one 
element, and later when they are more familiar with the 
Chinese character, they will create pictographs and ideographs 
composed of more elements. In our education process, we will 
let the children discuss each other’s (under the guide of the 
teacher) and their own creation and thus, they will develop 
their critical spirit because the similarities or dissimilarities of 
the characters created by them can be a cause of reflection 
regarding the different choices adopted in their work for a later 
discussion of the grade of efficiency of these choices. Finally, 
they will cooperate together to create the best character, 
because cooperation skills are also fundamental to the 
education process. This creative process also is useful for 
developing organization skills because they have to collect, 
organize, develop, edit, refine, and evaluate the visual material. 
Later, we will compare the students’ creation with the ancient 
characters to discuss the eventual similarities and divergences. 
If the children find some common aspect between their way of 
thinking and the ancient one, it will be easier to keep the 
interest on the archaic culture because they will not feel it 
totally unrelated and extraneous to them. In this way, they will 
develop a confidence with their own cultural roots. In fact, 
very often, the students could feel disheartened, discouraged, 
bored and disinterested in studying the ancient culture, one of 
the reasons being because they do not feel any relationship or 
link to it.  
 
Another exercise will be drawing a picture using the characters 
learned before, such as composition elements. In this way, they 
will enjoy the class because most children love drawing but at 
the same time, they will keep in mind the shape of the 
characters and their meaning and this will stimulate their 
creativity to create a coherent image. After creating several 
images with the consequential familiarity with an ample 
number of characters, they will create a short story, using them 
to develop their imagination and creativity more and more, 
feeling free to express themselves. Automatically, they will 
also exercise their memory: when they draw the characters, 
they will keep their shapes in mind, exercising the passive 
memory with the copy and the reproduction of the ancient 
character, and the active memory to create and compose a 
different character and drawing. For the Chinese students, 
learning the characters is very important at the same time as 
being difficult and laborious. In western countries, there is no 
such problem, because the letters of a phonetic alphabet (Greek, 
Latin, Russian etc.) are few and have a simple structure, and so 
the students will focus on different aspects of the language. 
However, in China, the huge number of characters and their 
complexity forces young students to put much effort into 
learning them. For learning the characters, the only method 
used in the Chinese class is to write and write them again to 
understand and remember the structure and the composition. In 
our class, with the creation of drawing, the students will keep 
on writing characters but in a pleasant way. 
 
Learning about cultures: mainly, they will study Chinese 
culture and customs, as explained before. This notion will be 
useful to enrich their cultural baggage and also their mental 
images archive. After the introduction and description of the 
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Abstract 

 
The undergraduate education in environmental desgin major 

plays an vital role in constructing a repertoire of complex  
students’profesional skills- set and knowledge; in order to 
achieve the enhancement of students’initiative, inclusion of 
social hot topics into the class teachings is discussed. In 
subjects of Architectural Spatial Layout and Art of Interior 
Display, a detailed dissect of social hot topics is conducted in 
stages of topic selection, research, discussion, design and 
presentation. The dissertation probes into the tectical strategy 
on the application of social hotpics and its postive impact on 
studying motivation. 
 
Key words: social hot topics, undergraduate design 
curriculum, study motivation，environmental desgin 

  
The Impact of Hot Topics on College Students 

     
As the formation of social network and increasing impact of 

new media on daily life, hot topics constantly expand outreach. 
Currently, the transmitting media of hot topics have changed, 
with more extensive range of content from current affairs to 
micro-videos on new media, which arouse widespread heated 
discussion and concern. Thus, hot topics become 
indispensable part of people’s daily life. As frequent users of 
new media and active participants and deeply affected group 
of hot topics, college students, with their spirit of 
independence, hold various public opinions towards a wide 
range of topics. They are sensitive and active thinking who 
could easily set off new trends in society via new media 
technology, which even make a difference on current culture 
and aesthetic views. Consequently, how to transplant the 
sensitivity and concentration of students on hot topics into 
undergraduate curriculum studying is worthy of deep research. 
[1]  

 
The Relation of Hot Topics and Design Curriculums  

 
Hot topics cover a wide range of subjects. The daily hot 

topics list on major websites and new media could be roughly 
classified into two categories. One includes international and 
domestic current affairs, politics, economy, social news, as 
well as various hot events closely related to people's livelihood. 
While the other are celebrity gossip, sports events, movies and 
TV plays and other cultural and entertainment hotspots. The 

former seems relatively heavy, students' attention paid on 
which is relatively dull. And the latter seems more relaxing and 
entertaining, whether it is gossip news in entertainment circle 
or new movies and TV plays. Often, it can quickly trigger a 
discussion wave among college students, with a wide audience 
and in a fast propaganda speed, and they often reflect 
nowadays’ most popular elements, with a strong timeliness 
and high acceptability. Therefore, the latter is more suitable for 
the introduction of design courses as background of the topic 
to arouse students' enthusiasm and desire for learning. 
Meanwhile, it can better display the characteristics of the 
design specialty leading fashion. Therefore, hot topics relate 
closely to design courses. Proper usage of it can provide good 
elements of introduction for design curriculums, stimulate 
students' learning motivation and improve quality of teaching. 
Epochal and prospective design works could be better 
presented. [2]  

Necessity of Application of Hot Topics Environmental 
Design 

 
Environment design is a comprehensive major in interior, 

landscape and soft-fitting design. In today's digital era, all 
kinds of design materials such as 3D model of network, 
material mapping and even the whole set of space model is 
convenient and easy to obtain, and the threshold is very low. 
This undoubtedly leads to identical design effect, more and 
more programs pursue "borrowlism", and the phenomenon of 
plagiarism is not rare. Social design chaos spreads into 
campuses. Students majoring in design often have similar 
schemes in the course of their homework. They think less 
about the design scheme and their conception lacks in 
originality. Under these circumstances, how to improve the 
quality of teaching, especially how to improve the originality 
of students' homework design, becomes an urgent problem in 
the environment designing major. 

Therefore, as front-line workers in environment design 
undergraduate teaching, we are dedicated to introducing hot 
topics as background of design topics into environment design 
curriculums, hoping to improve students' interest in learning. 
Due to the timeliness of hot topics and the distinct sense of the 
times, students want to find similar works. Examples are 
relatively difficult, which can effectively avoid plagiarism and 
imitation of design works and enhance the originality of works. 
In addition, in the current teaching activities, it is not difficult 
to find the situation of repeated use of courseware. Due to the 
slow updating of teachers' knowledge reserve, teachers lack 

  

characters and the creative exercises, we will display the same 
characters to them but from different pictographic writing 
systems to let them know and turn on their interest for a 
different culture. In this way, they can understand how 
different civilizations can have common or different ideas and 
expressions. Our modern society is characterized by 
globalization and so it is important to open the children’s mind 
to different cultures from an early age. 
 
Improving the aesthetic and artistic skills: using drawing and 
writing material for copying the characters first and later for 
creating new ones and the new images and stories, they will 
naturally develop their artistic skills. With the creation of the 
new characters, they will focus on the structure and on the use 
of the line. A character has to be understandable for everybody 
and so it has to follow some structural rules such as the balance 
of the strokes, the full space and the empty space, a coherence 
on the structure. The character has to be clear, and the lines 
neat and tidy. In the artistic learning, the competence in using 
the line is very important because it is the basis of painting and 
writing skills (in particular in Chinese art). With the second 
exercise, they will focus more on the drawing, in the 
composition of an image and the use of colors. They will learn 
illustration techniques, how to build an image and how to 
create a story using different pictures. They will improve these 
skills with a “synchronic” creative process during the drawing 
of one single image. When they draw a story, they will exercise 
the “diachronic” aspect of the creation process and develop 
sequential thinking to strengthen the organizational skills, and 
the logical and orderly mind processes and procedures. 
Consequently, it will secure their attention to detail, coherence 
in thinking and organization. Those skills are also fundamental 
in those activities involving the imagination, ideation, 
invention, and discovering new possibilities and options in 
every field of professional life. Naturally, they will improve 
and develop the synergy of brain, hand, and eye.  
 

Conclusion 
 
Our teaching method is based on illustration through drawing 
practice; the students will use different drawing materials, both 
western and traditional Chinese because it is important to mix 
and be open to the knowledge from different cultures; however, 
it is much more important to understand the differences and the 
similarities between them deeply. Thus, our class can be 
presented like an art class, and we will train in all the skills 
related to artistic learning: creativity, fantasy, imagination, 
aesthetic perception, practical skills in drawing and 
composition. Drawing can help to make out the ideas from the 
mind because sometimes children could find it difficult to 
express themselves. Therefore, thinking on the page can allow 
them to understand their own ideas better (develop the right 
side of the brain) and ponder on how to show them. After the 
creation, after putting their own ideas on paper, they will have 
a general vision of them, and later, after a process of analyzing, 
clarifying, editing, quantifying, and evaluating (this will 
develop the left side of the brain), they will have an awareness 
of themselves.  
 
A good teaching method should turn on the interest of students, 
and in this way, they will learn easily and deeply, developing 
their skills in a higher way without losing interest. We want to 

avoid passive learning much as possible, and for this reason, in 
our class, most of the time is dedicated to the creation of 
original works. All the knowledge we want to teach them they 
have already met during the standard classes. The new notions 
we will teach them are always expressed in an interesting way 
due to the link with the pictographs and their cultural heritage 
of legends, customs, and history. These new notions will be 
learnt in the other majors. Thus, our project is not limited to 
introducing a new class, but it will influence the whole 
teaching method. On the one hand, we want to stress the 
creative learning of the children, and on the other, we wish to 
create a system of communication between the different 
majors and the respective teachers, a synergistic background 
for improving the teaching efficiency day by day, based on 
cooperation and communication. In the new class, the students 
will enjoy themselves and relax and in fact, it is important that 
the learning process is also a leisure time. At the same time, 
they will review what they learnt in the other classes. After six 
years of this kind of training, the students’ artistic skill will be 
considerably developed, and their knowledge of Chinese 
characters will be deeper and solidified. In addition, they will 
have strengthened their mental agility, the linking skills, the 
capacity to go over the common thinking range thanks to a 
critical mind and eye, and the predisposition toward a creative 
approach to the world. 
 
Formally, our first purpose is to teach difficult and boring 
notions (Chinese characters) in an enjoyable way, but with 
deep analysis our method will exercise and build up very 
important brain skills to prepare the young students to be more 
intedependent in the future life. They are at the age of highest 
brain receptiveness. This is the period when it is very 
important to structure their mind to have a solid basis for the 
future. We think school is not just for learning new notions; it 
should also be the hotbed for the new generations where they 
will be prepared to face the world with an active, cognizant and 
creative spirit.  
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